FOI 0278/2022 Response 
1. For each month between and including March 2019 and December 2021, please provide the number of detentions of children (under 18) detained under Section 136 of the Mental Health Act 1983

	Month*
	Detentions

	31/01/2020
	2

	30/04/2020
	1

	31/05/2020
	1

	30/06/2020
	1

	31/07/2020
	3

	31/08/2020
	2

	31/10/2020
	3

	30/11/2020
	1

	31/12/2020
	3

	31/01/2021
	6

	28/02/2021
	3

	31/03/2021
	5

	30/04/2021
	1

	31/05/2021
	4

	31/07/2021
	1

	30/11/2021
	1

	31/12/2021
	4

	Grand Total
	42



*Months with no data had no detentions

2. The total number of individual children detained under Section 136 of the Mental Health Act during the following periods:

a. 28/02/2019 to 29/02/2020		

2

b. 01/03/2020 to 01/03/2021	

20

2. In reference to question (1), for each detention can you provide: 

Please see excel document.

a. The month and year of the detention (MM/YYYY)

Please see excel document.





b. The age of the child (broken down into the following bands to avoid potential identification): 
c. Please see excel document.

i. 0-5

ii. 5-11

iii. 12-15

iv. 16-17

d. The gender of the child 

Please see excel document.

e. The reason for detention 

This is not a reportable field and therefore we do not hold this information. 

f. Was it a detention of a child looked after by a local authority? 

Please note that the Trust only knows if a patient is LAC if they are in our Solihull CAMHS service.

g. Where did the detention take place: 

Please see excel document.

i. Accident and emergency department

ii. A paediatric ward

iii. A “place of safety” at a mental health trust
*** Clarification A health-based place of safety is a space where young people detained and transported under Section 135/136 (S135/136) of the Mental Health Act 1983 (amended 2007)1 can be managed safely while an appropriate assessment is undertaken (by a psychiatrist and an approved mental health professional (AMHP).

iv. Other

h. How long was the person detained? 

We are unable to report this for detentions that took place in A&E or a paediatric ward as we do not hold the data.




