
FOI 012/2022 Response 

1. The number of referrals for PTSD which have been recorded in your trust from the date 

period of March 2017 - March 2022, or the latest dates you have available. 

Please see table below and note the following: 

• The data has been provided in financial years. 

 

• Data has been provided in relation to the start of diagnosis rather than when the referral 

was received, to appropriately determine those suffering with PTSD.  

 

• The diagnosis has been restricted to those that were confirmed and that were against 

Community Referrals (i.e. inpatient not included). 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

2. The number of referrals for prolonged grief disorder which have been recorded in your 

trust for the date period of March 2017 - March 2022, or the latest dates you have 

available. 

The Trust is unable to provide a response to this query this is because we do not record 

diagnostic labels in relation to prolonged grief disorder. 

3. The number of referrals for traumatic bereavement for the period of March 2017 - March 

2022, or the latest dates you have available. 

The Trust is unable to provide a response to this query this is because we do not record 

diagnostic labels in relation to traumatic bereavement. 

 

 

Financial Year Referrals Patients 

FY 20212022 177 176 

FY 20202021 198 197 

FY 20192020 186 185 

FY 20182019 147 146 

FY 20172018 208 206 


