
FOI 0179/2023 Response 

 

Q1. How many individuals have been discharged to ‘no fixed abode’ from hospitals within your 
trust? Where possible please provide data both by individual medical department and as a whole 

(for the entire Trust).  

 

Please provide data for each of the following financial years: 

- 2022/2023 (or the latest financial year) 

- 2017/2018   

 

If you do not hold data on the number of individuals, please provide the number of discharges 

there have been to ‘no fixed abode’.  
 

Financial Year 

 

Q1. Num people discharged to NFA 

FY 2017/18 2 

FY 2022/23 11 

 

 

Q2a. Of those individuals who were discharged to ‘no fixed abode’ (in Q1) how many were 
readmitted within six months?  

 

Please provide data for each of the following financial years: 

- 2022/2023 (or the latest financial year) 

- 2017/2018   

 

If you do not hold data on the number of individuals, please provide the number of readmissions.  

 

Financial Year Q2(a) Of those, number of re-admitted individuals within 

6 months 

FY 2017/18 1 

FY 2022/23 1 

 

 

Q2b. Of the individuals in Q2a, how many individuals were readmitted because of substance use 

issues?  

 

Please provide data for each of the following financial years: 

- 2022/2023  (or the latest financial year) 

- 2017/2018   

 

Financial Year 

Q2(b) Of those, number of re-admitted individuals with 

substance abuse 

FY 2017/18 1 

FY 2022/23 0 

 

 

 

 



Q3. Does your NHS Trust have guidance/policy in place that details how to support a patient who 

is being discharged from hospital to ‘no fixed abode’? 

 

The Trust has in place /adheres to the Admission, Transfer, Discharge & Community Follow Up 

Policy. We do not have a specific policy in relation to patients with no fixed abodes.  

 


