FOI 0242/2023 Response

I would like the following information please for the following periods,
15 April 2022 - 31°* March 2023
And
1%t April 2022 — 29t August 2023
1. The exact number of admin posts advertised and their banding.

1t April 2022 - 31° March 2023

e 5 apprenticeships

e 44Band?2
e 120Band 3
e 124Band4
e 58Band5
e 30Band®6
e 39Band?7
e 23Band8a
e 12 Band8b
e 1Band8c
e 2Band8d
e 2Band9

e 1 Consultant
e 2 Non-Executive

15t April 2022 — 29" August 2023

e 5apprenticeships

e 48Band2
e 154Band3
e 174Band4
e 80Band5
e 40Band®6
e 47Band?7
e 32Band8&a
e 15Band8b
e 4Band8c
e 3Band8d
e 3Band9

e 1 Consultant
e 2 Non-Executive

2. The exact number of admin posts advertised that required a typing test as an essential
requirement of the interview process?

The Trust is unable to provide a response to this query. This is because all selection
processes are managed locally by the recruiting managers and tests, presentation, selection,
and processes that are used are not recorded centrally.



3. The exact number of those interviews where a typing test was undertaken as part of the
interview?

The Trust is unable to provide a response to this query. This is because all selection

processes are managed locally by the recruiting managers and tests, presentation, selection,
and processes that are used are not recorded centrally.



