
FOI 058/2022 Response  

1.A record of suicides by people (aged 0-25); separated by trust, gender, ethnicity, religion, 

disability, and sexuality, since 2016, 

Disclaimer:  

The table above shows the number of Commissioner Reportable suicides of patients aged 0-25 at 

Birmingham & Solihull Mental Health Foundation Trust between Jan 2016 – Jun 2022. 

2.A record of suicides by people (aged 0-25), who were under the care of CAMHS (or equivalent); 

separated by trust, gender, ethnicity, religion, disability, and sexuality, since 2016, 

Disclaimer:  

The table above shows the number of Commissioner Reportable suicides of patients aged 0-25 

under the care of CAMHS at Birmingham & Solihull Mental Health Foundation Trust between Jan 

2016 – Jun 2022. The patient listed in the table above was under the care of the CAMHS Community 

Services. 

 

Year Gender Ethnicity Religion Disability Sexuality 

2016 Female White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Not 

Religious 

N Other 

2016 Male White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

2016 Male White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

2017 Male Unknown Unknown N Unknown 

2018 Male Asian / Asian British - Indian Unknown N Unknown 

2018 Male White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

2019 Male White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown Unknown Unknown 

2021 Male White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

2021 Female White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Not 

Religious 

N Unknown 

 

Year Gender Ethnicity Religion Disability Sexuality 

2021 Male White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

 



3.A record of suicides by people (aged 0-25), who were on the CAMHS (or equivalent) waiting list; 

separated by trust, gender, ethnicity, religion, disability, and sexuality, since 2016, 

We have no records of patients aged 0-25 having committed suicide whilst on the CAMHS waiting 

list.  

4.A record of suicides by people (aged 0-25), who previously accessed CAMHS (or equivalent) 

services but had been discharged; separated by trust, gender, ethnicity, religion, disability, and 

sexuality, since 2016. 

We have no records of patients aged 0-25 committing suicide having been discharged from the 

Trust’s CAMHS services.  

5.A record of attempted suicides made by people (aged 0-25); separated by trust, gender, 

ethnicity, religion, disability, and sexuality, since 2016. 

 

Disclaimer:  

The table above shows incidents of attempted suicide by patients aged 0-25 at Birmingham & 

Solihull Mental Health Foundation Trust between Jan 2016 – Jun 2022. 

 

 

 

 

Year Gender Ethnicity Religion Disability Sexuality 

2016 Female White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

2016 Female White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

2017 Female White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Atheist N Unknown 

2018 Male White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Unknown 

2018 Male Unknown Unknown N Unknown 

2019 Male Asian or Asian British - Pakistani Unknown N Unknown 

2019 Female White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Not 

Religious 

N Unknown 

2021 Non 

binary 

White - 

English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern 

Irish/British 

Unknown N Gay / 

Lesbian 

 



6.A record of referrals to CAMHS (or equivalent) of people (aged 0-25); separated by trust, gender, 

ethnicity, religion, disability, and sexuality, since 2016. 

Please see table below and note the following: 

The table holds aggregated responses for questions 6 &7. 

for Q7 Crisis referrals identified as referrals where the receiving Team was Crisis or where the source 

of referral to CAMHS was A&E 

 

 

Total Crisis

Referrals 01 Jan 2016 - 31 May 2022 13,332 618

Referrals by Gender

Gender Total Crisis

Female 6,947 385

Male 6,369 229

Non binary 13 4

Unknown 3 0

Total Referrals by Sexual Orientation 

Sexual Orientation Total Crisis

Bisexual 5 2

Gay 10 2

Heterosexual 46 8

Other 2

Unknown 13,269 606

Referrals by Disabled Status

Disabled Total Crisis

N 13,328 618

Y 4 0

Referrals by Ethnicity

Ethnicity Total Crisis

Any other Ethnic Group 79 2

Any other mixed / multiple ethnic background 614 14

Arab 7

Asian / Asian British - Chinese 27 1

Asian / Asian British - Indian 198 9

Asian or Asian British - Any other background 57 4

Asian or Asian British - Bangladeshi 32 2

Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 189 4

Black / Black British - African 31 2

Black / Black British - Caribbean 59 6

Black / Black British - Other 24 1

EPEX Not recorded 3

Mixed - White & Asian 198 10

Mixed - White & Black African 37 4

Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 343 11

Not Asked 1,377 87

Not Stated (Client Refused) 1,139 55

White - English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern Irish/British 8,622 385

White - Gypsy or Irish Traveller 5

White - Irish 45 4

White - Other 246 17

Grand Total 13,332

Referrals by Religion

Religion Total Crisis

Agnostic 7 2

Atheist 17 3

Christian 59 3

Church of England 55

Hindu 13 2

Jehovah's Witness 7 2

Muslim 49 2

Not Asked 435 42

Not recorded 12

Not Religious 50 6

Not Stated (Refused) 83 4

Other Religion (not on list) 4 1

Pagan 5

Roman Catholic 42

Shi'ite Muslim 1

Sikh 16

Unknown 12,477 551



7.A record of referrals made to CAMHS (or equivalent) by the Mental Health Crisis Team of young 

people (aged -0-25); separated by trust, gender, ethnicity, religion, disability, and sexuality, since 

2016. 

Please see response in question 6.  

 

 


