
FOI 096/2023 Response 

 

1. For each year (2020 – 2022), please confirm how many cyberattacks your Trust has 

suffered? – 

 

- None 

 

2. For each year (2020 – 2022), please confirm how many cyberattacks have resulted in the 

halting of or delay in delivery of care or services to patients?  

 

- None 

 

3. For each year (2020-2022), please confirm: 

a. The GBP (£) value of budget allocated to cybersecurity  

 

- Not recorded 

 

b. What percentage of the Trust’s entire budget for the financial year was spent on 
cybersecurity?  

 

- Not recorded 

 

4. How many times in the last 12 months have you audited your third-party suppliers’ 
cybersecurity measures?  

 

- None 

 


