
FOI 0526/2025 Response 

1. The total number of beds in all the hospitals and wards under your trust or 

foundation. 

How many inpatient beds 

does your hospital have 

(hospital site in brackets) 

What specific Adult services 

(please list) 

86 (Ardenleigh) 

Secure CAMHS / Medium Secure 

Adult / Adult Acute / Community 

Rehabilitation 

15 (Dan Mooney House) Long Term Rehabilitation 

15 (David Bromley House) Long Term Rehabilitation 

16 (Eden Unit) Adult Acute 

14 (Endeavour Court) High Dependency Rehabilitation 

12 (Endeavour House) Adult Acute 

12 (Forward House) Community Rehabilitation 

10 (Grove Avenue) Community Rehabilitation 

10 (Hertford House) Community Rehabilitation 

24 (Highcroft Site) Adult Acute / Adult PICU 

15 (Hillis Lodge) Low Secure Adult 

53 (Juniper Centre) Older Adult Acute 

40 (Mary Seacole House) Adult Acute / Adult PICU 

16 (Newbridge House) Adult Acute 

74 (Oleaster) Adult Acute / Adult PICU 

92 (Reaside Clinic) Medium Secure Adult 

18 (Reservoir Court) Older Adult Acute 

89 (Tamarind Centre) Medium Secure Adult 

32 (The Barberry) 

Specialty Deaf / Specialty Perinatal / 

Specialty Eating Disorder / Specialty 

Neuropsychiatry 

32 (The Zinnia Centre) Adult Acute 
  

 

 

 

 



2. Total number of patients who were ‘medically fit for discharge’ (MFFD) or no longer 
meet the criteria to reside as mentioned in the latest NHS England data, but 

remained in hospital for seven days or longer between 1 January 2024 and 1 January 

2025 because they had no recourse to public funds (NRPF) as highlighted here. 

Please provide the information from all the hospitals under the trust or foundation. 

Information not recorded 

Note: As a mental health Trust, discharge delays are coded under national definitions of 

‘Clinically Ready for Discharge’, with a stated reason (MENTAL HEALTH CLINICALLY 

READY FOR DISCHARGE PERIOD DELAY REASON) and attribution (MENTAL HEALTH 

CLINICALLY READY FOR DISCHARGE PERIOD ATTRIBUTABLE TO INDICATION CODE).  

These reasons are not sufficiently detailed enough to cover patients with no recourse to 

public funds, or at risk of or experiencing homelessness, therefore Q2 cannot be 

answered 

3. Total number of patients who were ‘medically fit for discharge’ (MFFD) or no longer 
meet the criteria to reside as mentioned in the latest NHS England data, but 

remained in hospital for seven days or longer between 1 January 2024 and 1 January 

2025 because of the lack of social care. Please provide the information from all the 

hospitals under the trust or foundation. 

161 patients experienced a delay attributed solely to social care or jointly to NHS and 

social care. 

4. Total number of patients who were ‘medically fit for discharge’ (MFFD) or no longer 
meet the criteria to reside as mentioned in the latest NHS England data, but 

remained in the hospital for seven days or longer between 1 January 2024 and 1 

January 2025 because they were at risk of or experiencing homelessness. 

Information not recorded 

Note: As a mental health Trust, discharge delays are coded under national definitions of 

‘Clinically Ready for Discharge’, with a stated reason (MENTAL HEALTH CLINICALLY 

READY FOR DISCHARGE PERIOD DELAY REASON) and attribution (MENTAL HEALTH 

CLINICALLY READY FOR DISCHARGE PERIOD ATTRIBUTABLE TO INDICATION CODE).  

These reasons are not sufficiently detailed enough to cover patients with no recourse to 

public funds or at risk of or experiencing homelessness, therefore Q4 cannot be 

answered 

5. Total number of patients who were ‘medically fit for discharge’ (MFFD) or no longer 
meet the criteria to reside as mentioned in the latest NHS England data, but 

remained in the hospital for seven days or longer between 1 January 2024 and 1 

January 2025 because of any other reasons. 
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