FOI 0318/2025 Request

Q1. Which application tracking or recruitment system does your Trust use for locally
employed / non-training resident doctor positions (e.g., Junior Clinical Fellow, Clinical

Teaching Fellow)? Examples include TracJobs, NHS Jobs, or others.

Trac

Q2. For each of the past five years (2020-2025), please provide the total number of
advertised non-training doctor vacancies, specifically:
a. Junior Clinical Fellow

TRAC does not retain recruitment information beyond 12 months, and unfortunately, and
we do not have access to the data in question.

Additionally, some of the doctors were recruited via Postgraduate Medical Education

(PGME), and we do not hold this data.

However we can provide the following information:

Number of Trust Grade, Las
Month Applicants Clinical Fellow Number posts
Nov 2024
Dec 2024 1 LAS 1
Jan 2025 156 Trust Grade 3
Feb 2025 211 Clinical fellow 5
Mar 2025 0
Apr 2025 930 Trust Grade, LAS JCF 4
May 2025 4 Trust Grade, LAS JCF 3
Jun 2025 0
Jul 2025 279 Trust Grade, LAS JCF 4
Aug 2025 111 Trust Grade, LAS JCF 2
Sept 2025 0
Oct 0
Nov 0

b. Clinical Teaching Fellow

TRAC does not retain recruitment information beyond 12 months, and unfortunately, and
we do not have access to the data in question.

Additionally, some of the doctors were recruited via PGME, and we do not hold this data.

However, please refer to the table in question 2a.

c. Anyequivalent titles used in your Trust (please specify titles if different)

N/A




Q3. For each year from 2020 to 2025, how many applications were received for the
vacancies listed in Question 2.

TRAC does not retain recruitment information beyond 12 months, and unfortunately, and we do
not have access to the data in question.

Additionally, some of the doctors were recruited via PGME and we do not hold this data.
However, please refer to the table in question 2a.
Q4. For each recruitment round in 2025, how long (in days) were the job vacancies listed in
Question 2 open before being closed?
Please note that job postings are generally open for a period of 5 to 10 days.
Q5. Does your Trust use a numerical cap on the number of applications received before
closing avacancy early?

a. Ifyes, whatis the usual threshold for the roles listed above?
To clarify, we currently do not use an application cap on TRAC

Q6. Does your Trust have a policy or guideline related to the use of Artificial Intelligence
(Al) in job applications, either by applicants or during screening? If so, please provide a

copy.
We do not have a specific policy or guideline related to the use of Artificial Intelligence (Al) in job

applications. However, we are updating our guidance in line with NHS Employers
recommendations.

Q7. Do you use Al to shortlist applications in any way? If so, what Al do you use and for
what purpose.

No

Q8. Does your Trust use any tools or software to detect the use of Al-generated contentin
job applications or supporting documents (e.g., personal statements)?

No

Q9. If Al-detection tools are used, how many job applications for the roles listed above (in
2025) were flagged for suspected Al-generated content?

N/A
Q10. Has your Trust rejected any applications in 2025 specifically on the basis of
suspected or confirmed Al-generated content? If yes, how many, and what criteria were

used?

We are not aware of any occurrences of this.



