
FOI 0361/2025 Request  

Dear FOI Team, 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 I request the most recent snapshot you 

hold (ide-date: 1 November 2025 or latest available day). Please give one number 

per question (or “not held” + sign-post). Excel / CSV ideal; plain text fine. 

1. Complex physical healthcare packages How many adult Continuing 
Healthcare (CHC) or jointly funded packages are currently live where the 
primary need is recorded as complex physical (not mental health / LDA)?   

The afore mentioned packages are not funded by the provider collaborative. 

The Integrated Care Board (ICB) retains responsibility for all funding that sits 
under the National Continuing Health Care (CHC) framework.  

For further details please contact Birmingham and Solihull ICB: 
contactusbsolics@nhs.net.  

2. >4-week allocation delays Of the packages in Q3, how many have waited >28 
calendar days from “fully funded” date to “provider accepted & started 
care”? –  

We are unable to provide the requested information as we do not currently 
routinely collate this information.  

3. Bed-blocking / delayed discharge Latest daily average (or total bed-days last 
month) where the primary reason is “awaiting community care package” 
(acute + community beds). 

 

We do not hold the requested information in relation to specialist placement and 
s177 team as this is wider than our service.  

4. Patients stuck in hospital On the snapshot date, how many in-patients are 
medically Ʊt (“No Criteria to Reside”) but delayed solely because no 
community package is available?  

We do not hold the requested information as is wider than our service.  

5. Tier 4 LDA waiting list (ICB only) Current total number of patients waiting for 
a Tier 4 LDA bed commissioned by your ICB (CAMHS + adult secure).   

We do not hold this data please redirect to the ICB. 

For further details please contact Birmingham and Solihull ICB: 
contactusbsolics@nhs.net.  

https://www.bing.com/ck/a?!&&p=18e9a564e1ddacbe0a032824359c5a35b6a10e7966cd3e18f6d0aac4a9dd03a9JmltdHM9MTc2Mzk0MjQwMA&ptn=3&ver=2&hsh=4&fclid=19ed0488-9106-63b9-21f9-12f090bd6265&u=a1aHR0cHM6Ly93d3cuZW5nbGFuZC5uaHMudWsvY29udGFjdC11cy9hYm91dC1uaHMtc2VydmljZXMvY29udGFjdC15b3VyLWxvY2FsLWludGVncmF0ZWQtY2FyZS1ib2FyZC1pY2Iv&ntb=1
https://www.bing.com/ck/a?!&&p=18e9a564e1ddacbe0a032824359c5a35b6a10e7966cd3e18f6d0aac4a9dd03a9JmltdHM9MTc2Mzk0MjQwMA&ptn=3&ver=2&hsh=4&fclid=19ed0488-9106-63b9-21f9-12f090bd6265&u=a1aHR0cHM6Ly93d3cuZW5nbGFuZC5uaHMudWsvY29udGFjdC11cy9hYm91dC1uaHMtc2VydmljZXMvY29udGFjdC15b3VyLWxvY2FsLWludGVncmF0ZWQtY2FyZS1ib2FyZC1pY2Iv&ntb=1


 

6. Tier 4 enhanced staƯing On the snapshot date, how many Tier 4 in-patients 
(any unit) require 2:1, 3:1 or 4:1+ staƯing (exclude standard 1:1)?   

We do not hold this data please redirect to the ICB. 

For further details please contact Birmingham and Solihull ICB: 
contactusbsolics@nhs.net.  

7. Procurement pipeline – next 6 months Please attach (or paste) your 
anonymised re-procurement tracker:     

o Package ref 

o Postcode sector 

o Weekly hours 

o Current provider (or “spot”) 

o Expected tender month (Redact any personal data.) 

NIL (0) 

8. Best contact Name, job title, email & phone of the commissioner who 
awards complex care packages in your ICB/Trust.  

The Integrated Care Board (ICB) retains responsibility awards complex care 
packages.  For details of best contact please redirect your query to the ICB.  

For further details please contact Birmingham and Solihull ICB: 
contactusbsolics@nhs.net.  

 

 

https://www.bing.com/ck/a?!&&p=18e9a564e1ddacbe0a032824359c5a35b6a10e7966cd3e18f6d0aac4a9dd03a9JmltdHM9MTc2Mzk0MjQwMA&ptn=3&ver=2&hsh=4&fclid=19ed0488-9106-63b9-21f9-12f090bd6265&u=a1aHR0cHM6Ly93d3cuZW5nbGFuZC5uaHMudWsvY29udGFjdC11cy9hYm91dC1uaHMtc2VydmljZXMvY29udGFjdC15b3VyLWxvY2FsLWludGVncmF0ZWQtY2FyZS1ib2FyZC1pY2Iv&ntb=1
https://www.bing.com/ck/a?!&&p=18e9a564e1ddacbe0a032824359c5a35b6a10e7966cd3e18f6d0aac4a9dd03a9JmltdHM9MTc2Mzk0MjQwMA&ptn=3&ver=2&hsh=4&fclid=19ed0488-9106-63b9-21f9-12f090bd6265&u=a1aHR0cHM6Ly93d3cuZW5nbGFuZC5uaHMudWsvY29udGFjdC11cy9hYm91dC1uaHMtc2VydmljZXMvY29udGFjdC15b3VyLWxvY2FsLWludGVncmF0ZWQtY2FyZS1ib2FyZC1pY2Iv&ntb=1

