
Q1 - Total Inpatients during the year (2023/24) Q2 - Total Inpatients experiencing restrictive practice (2023/24) Q3 - Total Restrictive Intervention Incidents (2023/24)

Gender Gender Gender

CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total

Female 2 979 981 Female 2 303 305 Female 77 2834 2911

Male 8 1215 1223 Male 6 329 335 Male 48 1811 1859

Non binary 1 1 2 Non binary 1 1 2 Non binary 346 3 349

Total 11 2195 2206 Total 9 633 642 Total 471 4648 5119

Ethnicity Ethnicity Ethnicity

CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total

Any other Ethnic Group 48 48 Any other Ethnic Group 13 13 Any other Ethnic Group 95 95

Any other mixed / multiple ethnic background 29 29 Any other mixed / multiple ethnic background 10 10 Any other mixed / multiple ethnic background 91 91

Arab 21 21 Arab 7 7 Arab 47 47

Asian / Asian British - Chinese 10 10 Asian / Asian British - Chinese 3 3 Asian / Asian British - Chinese 4 4

Asian / Asian British - Indian 79 79 Asian / Asian British - Indian 24 24 Asian / Asian British - Indian 122 122

Asian or Asian British - Any othe 1 49 50 Asian or Asian British - Any other background 1 12 13 Asian or Asian British - Any other background 3 57 60

Asian or Asian British - Banglade 1 39 40 Asian or Asian British - Bangladeshi 1 14 15 Asian or Asian British - Bangladeshi 24 91 115

Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 223 223 Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 66 66 Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 319 319

Black / Black British - African 142 142 Black / Black British - African 54 54 Black / Black British - African 428 428

Black / Black British - Caribbean 1 270 271 Black / Black British - Caribbean 82 82 Black / Black British - Caribbean 342 342

Black / Black British - Other 40 40 Black / Black British - Other 14 14 Black / Black British - Other 114 114

Mixed - White & Asian 14 14 Mixed - White & Asian 3 3 Mixed - White & Asian 7 7

Mixed - White & Black African 15 15 Mixed - White & Black African 6 6 Mixed - White & Black African 31 31

Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 74 74 Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 26 26 Mixed - White & Black Caribbean 88 88

Not Asked 43 43 Not Asked 10 10 Not Asked 40 40

Not Stated (Client Refused) 32 32 Not Stated (Client Refused) 7 7 Not Stated (Client Refused) 20 20

White - English/Welsh/Scottish 8 995 1003 White - English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern Irish/British 7 264 271 White - English/Welsh/Scottish/Northern Irish/British 444 2610 3054

White - Gypsy or Irish Traveller 2 2 White - Gypsy or Irish Traveller 1 1 White - Gypsy or Irish Traveller 3 3

White - Irish 12 12 White - Irish 1 1 White - Irish 6 6

White - Other 58 58 White - Other 16 16 White - Other 133 133

Total 11 2195 2206 Total 9 633 642 Total 471 4648 5119

Religion/Belief Religion/Belief Religion/Belief

CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total

7th Day Adventist 2 2 Agnostic 1 1 Agnostic 4 4

Agnostic 10 10 Anglican 1 1 Anglican 7 7

Anglican 1 1 Atheist 5 5 Atheist 12 12

Atheist 15 15 Baptist 2 2 Baptist 3 3

Baptist 6 6 Buddhist 2 2 Buddhist 5 5

Born Again Christian 1 1 Christian 68 68 Christian 752 752

Buddhist 5 5 Church of England 46 46 Church of England 477 477

Christian 216 216 Church of God of Prophecy 1 1 Church of God of Prophecy 4 4

Church of England 155 155 Hindu 2 2 Hindu 3 3

Church of God of Prophecy 3 3 Jehovah's Witness 2 2 Jehovah's Witness 6 6

Church of Scotland 1 1 Jewish 1 1 Jewish 6 6

Evangelical 1 1 Methodist 1 1 Methodist 1 1

Greek Orthodox 1 1 Muslim 52 52 Muslim 332 332

Hindu 8 8 Not Asked 12 12 Not Asked 98 98

Jehovah's Witness 6 6 Not Known 11 11 Not Known 77 77

Jewish 5 5 Not recorded 71 71 Not recorded 314 314

Methodist 6 6 Not Religious 34 34 Not Religious 216 216

Muslim 200 200 Not Stated (Refused) 8 8 Not Stated (Refused) 185 185

Not Asked 50 50 Other Religion (not on list) 7 7 Other Religion (not on list) 44 44

Not Known 34 34 Pentecostalist / Pentecostal Christian 3 3 Pentecostalist / Pentecostal Christian 4 4

Not recorded 285 285 Radna Krishna Temple 1 1 Radna Krishna Temple 6 6

Not Religious 118 118 Rastafari 7 7 Rastafari 43 43

Not Stated (Refused) 35 35 Rastafarian 1 1 Rastafarian 11 11

Orthodox Jew 1 1 Roman Catholic 30 30 Roman Catholic 222 222

Other Religion (not on list) 11 11 Seventh Day Adventist 3 3 Seventh Day Adventist 16 16

Pagan 2 2 Sikh 6 6 Sikh 20 20

Pentecostal 3 3 Spiritualist 3 3 Spiritualist 7 7

Pentecostalist / Pentecostal Christian 6 6 Sunni Muslim 1 1 Sunni Muslim 6 6

Protestant 2 2 Unknown 9 251 260 Unknown 471 1767 2238

Radna Krishna Temple 1 1 Total 9 633 642 Total 471 4648 5119

Rastafari 11 11

Rastafarian 1 1

Roman Catholic 93 93

Seventh Day Adventist 3 3

Sikh 23 23

Spiritualist 4 4

Sunni Muslim 1 1

Unknown 11 869 880

Total 11 2195 2206

Disability Disability Disability

CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total

No 2 701 703 No 1 202 203 No 346 1205 1551

Unknown 6 789 795 Unknown 6 204 210 Unknown 64 1182 1246

Yes 3 705 708 Yes 2 227 229 Yes 61 2261 2322

Total 11 2195 2206 Total 9 633 642 Total 471 4648 5119

Sexual Orientation Sexual Orientation Sexual Orientation

CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total

Bisexual 14 14 Bisexual 6 6 Bisexual 91 91

Gay 19 19 Gay 5 5 Gay 66 66

Heterosexual 5 911 916 Heterosexual 4 257 261 Heterosexual 88 1955 2043

Not known 6 1203 1209 Not known 5 349 354 Not known 383 2453 2836

Not stated 44 44 Not stated 15 15 Not stated 82 82

Other 4 4 Other 1 1 Other 1 1

Total 11 2195 2206 Total 9 633 642 Total 471 4648 5119

Restraint Type Restraint Type

CAMHS Adult Total CAMHS Adult Total

Chemical restraint - Injection (Non Rapid Tranquillisation) 1 25 26 Chemical restraint - Injection (Non Rapid Tranquillisation) 1 26 27

Chemical restraint - Injection (Rapid Tranquillisation) 3 285 288 Chemical restraint - Injection (Rapid Tranquillisation) 84 838 922

Chemical restraint - Oral 4 157 161 Chemical restraint - Oral 13 270 283

Chemical restraint - Other (not listed) 1 5 6 Chemical restraint - Other (not listed) 1 5 6

Mechanical Restraint 2 10 12 Mechanical Restraint 5 10 15

Physical Restraint - Kneeling 2 25 27 Physical Restraint - Kneeling 2 43 45

Physical Restraint - Prone 3 276 279 Physical Restraint - Prone 37 685 722

Physical Restraint - Restrictive escort 4 226 230 Physical Restraint - Restrictive escort 17 524 541

Physical Restraint - Seated 5 179 184 Physical Restraint - Seated 146 696 842

Physical Restraint - Side 2 97 99 Physical Restraint - Side 10 178 188

Physical Restraint - Standing 6 293 299 Physical Restraint - Standing 45 733 778

Physical Restraint - Supine 4 76 80 Physical Restraint - Supine 83 188 271

Seclusion 5 178 183 Seclusion 18 447 465

Segregation 4 5 9 Segregation 9 5 14

Total 9 633 642 Total 471 4648 5119

 Request 

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are submitting a request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding admissions into mental health inpatient services, disaggregated by demographic characteristics.

1. For the financial year 2023/24, please give the total number of patients disaggregated collectively by disaggregated by gender, ethnicity, and religion or belief, disability status, and sexual orientation admitted into:

a) CAMHS in-patient services*

b) Adult mental health in-patient services

2. For the financial year 2023/24, and disaggregated by gender, ethnicity, and religion or belief, disability status, sexual orientation and restraint type, i.e. prone restraint (also known as face-down restraint), chemical restraint, etc., please give the number of patients 

who experienced restraint by one or more members of staff in both:

a) adult inpatient mental health services

b) CAMHS inpatient mental health services*

3. For the financial year 2023/24, and disaggregated by gender, ethnicity, and religion or belief, disability status, and sexual orientation and restraint type, i.e. prone restraint (also known as face-down restraint), chemical restraint, etc., please give the number of 

incidents of restraint experienced by patients in both:

a) adult inpatient mental health services

b) CAMHS inpatient mental health services*

*If your ICB does not provide in-patient CAMHS services please make this clear.
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